
As computers are being used more and more in education, there will be soon no role for 
teachers in the classroom. Do you agree or disagree.

The advent of computers has revolutionized the way we are living. This phenomenon has 
sparked a heated debate among researchers some of whom assume that due to this 
alteration, no longer do we need the presence of teachers at schools. It means that 
students are capable of learning an array of subjects through online systems. I, personally, 
assert that not only is the duty of teachers not just allotted to transferring scientific issues, 
but they also have to teach students how they should behave in society. That is why I 
disagree with the given idea.

First and foremost, in a society where children study at home and undependent of 
schools' teachers, they will be isolated. The case in point is some offspring spending most 
of their time at their room and tends not to interact with others. These people will have 
numerous difficulties in the future. For example, these isolated members of the public can 
not develop a prosperous future at the workplace where they should communicate with 
their colleagues. Further and even more importantly is associated with the fact that 
nowadays teachers teach different scientific concepts and then learners can do homework 
or carry out projects based on what they acquire, thus without the contribution of 
teachers/ the guide/leaders they are not able to learn basic facts.

On the other hand, proponents concur that the personality of under-aged members of the 
public is completely different from those of their counterparts in the past meaning that 
they prefer to educate through their gadgets which is of great benefit for them. The 
pivotal reason is that in this way they should not waste their time travellinggoing to 
school. In addition, they will have more concentration at what they study by themselves.

On the whole, I once again reaffirm my position regarding the detrimental effects of 
studying via technological devices. I believe that with teachers in addition to/besides 
learning lessons, children get familiar with numerous effective skills which are completely 
necessary for their future.


